
DRAWING FROM THE WORLD AROUND YOU with Aijung Kim 
 
Note: If you do not want to spend much money on materials, please use what you have 
and don’t feel like you need to get fancy. Most of these materials may already be 
available to you, but I recommend shopping at Plaza Art for additional materials:  
 
Plaza Art 
927 West Grace Street 
Richmond, VA 23220 
Phone: 804-359-5900 
 
I will be giving optional “homework” assignments for those who want a little more 
practice outside of our online Zoom class time. If you do not have time outside of class, 
don’t worry about it.  
 
MATERIALS: 
- For out first class, we will be drawing from objects you have in your home (or outside, if 
you prefer). You may want to gather an assortment of objects to draw and have them 
near you.  
 
- A sketchbook OR sheets of paper to draw on. You may use any size sketchbook that 
you like, but I recommend a larger sketchbook if you want more space to draw on. Use 
what is comfortable for you. We will be using some ink or paint in some sketchbook 
pages, so it’s best to choose pages that are slightly thicker or are meant to withstand wet 
media (but really, use whatever you are comfortable with!) You may also choose to use 
whatever paper you have on hand for our first class and wait to purchase a sketchbook 
afterwards. If using sheets of paper, you also need a backing support like a drawing 
board or non-bending cardboard.  
 
- Drawing pen - Micron, pilot pen, or Papermate Flair pen recommended, but anything 
will do.   
 
- Pencil. It can just be a regular writing pencil or you can purchase an assortment of 
pencil grades if you like. It’s up to you whether you think you think you want to 
experiment more with different kinds of pencils. Otherwise, one basic pencil will be fine. 
 
- Small jar of India Ink OR watercolors. We won’t be working with color as much in this 
class (though feel free to if you like!) so it doesn’t matter what color you use. Black ink 
will be fine unless you want to experiment more with color. 
 
- Cardstock or thin cardboard, cut into 4 long rectangles (recommended to cut into 1” x 
8” strips, but any similar proportions will do) 
 
- Masking or scotch tape 


